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Parish Notices

by the Committee

his is our last PR before the conven-
tion and it contains useful informa-
tion, so please readit carefully and if

you’re not familiar with the geography of
the centre of Liverpool, don’t lose the map
we've provided on pageeight.

Cake Burning

Intervention will be holding the tradi-
tional Wincon Cake Burning contestin the
Fan Lounge on Saturday afternoon. See
PR3 for entry categories andrules.

Pork Pie Race

The legendary Pork Pie Contest returns;
find out more at the convention.

Call for Volunteers

Every convention needs gophers. ‘What
are gophers?’ I hear you cry. These are the
people who volunteer to run around doing
things at the convention, going for this and
going for that. They’re very important to
the success orfailure of a convention. NO
experienceis necessary and it’s a good way
to meet people and find your way around.

Programme Participants

It’s a little late to makeuse of new ideas,
but new blood, new people with interesting
things to say, are always welcome.If you’d
like to take part in the programme,please
fill in the enclosed form.Please also tell us
about yourself, the more you tell us, the
better we can fit you into our programme.

Beyond Cyberdrome

SMSand Ewokare throwing down the
gauntletto all you robot designers out there
for the return of the Cyberdrome robot
battle. The rules are simple: 1. This is for
fun; the last robot left standing is the win-
ner. 2. No projectile weaponsare to be used
and damageis not to be caused to the hotel’s
floor. 3. The robot must be able to move on
its own. 4. The judgesdecisionis final. SMS
has particularly asked that at least one team
fromthe convention tech crew enter a robot
and has added that the organizers would

particularly like to see a knitted and/or
organic robot this year! The Blue Peter
approachis just the thing for this event.

Phlosque Award

SMSand Eira would also like to announce
that they will be awarding the Phlosque
Award once more, for cute SF/fantasy art.

SF Theatre ofLiverpool

Meanwhile in another part of the pro-
gramme stream... One ofthe majorthrills of
running Intervention, aside fromthe chance
to work with our truly impressive guests, is
the opportunity to put on a new perform-
ance from the Science Fiction Theatre of
Liverpool. In addition to this we will be
presenting a history of this amazing troupe
together with videos of interviews and past
performances.

Ping

Another item which may catch your
interest and which requires some previous
preparation, in line with current views on
the importance of homework,isthe Ping on
the work of Anthony Burgess with particu-
lar reference to A Clockwork Orange, The
End of The World News and Any Old Iron
(possibly the least Arthurian Arthurian novel
ever). Even if you are not interested in the
item the books are worth reading. We are
still interviewing candidates for the post of
Reeve.

Foundation

For those of uswho missed last summer’s
academic conference ‘Speaking Science Fic-
tion’ at the University of Liverpool, Foun-
dation Administrator Andy Sawyeris plan-
ning a numberof seminars onthemes which
put SF and fandom into anacademicsetting.

Programme

Inthe meantime the programme contin-
uesto develop in accordance withthe theory
that a one line summary of the item should
be sufficient to cause a fight.

In our attempts to study communication
in all its aspects, we are being continually
proddedby events in the outside world. An
item examining the requirement of faster-
than-light communications for any inter-
stellar society is given fresh impetus by the
announcement by a Germanscientist that

 



 

he has managedto transmit Mozart’s 40th
Symphonyat 4.7c over distance of 14cm.
A discussion on the cultural basis of lan-
guage, and thus the inherentdifficulties of
diplomacy,is throwninto relief both by the
discovery in the European Union of a new
word to fundamentally disagree over (flex-
ibility) and by the claim from the USA that
languagehas not simply a cultural root but
a genetic one.

Ontop of all this there will be the old
favourites of course. The Masqueradeisin
the capable hands of Alice Lawson, while
Mike Whitakeris in charge of the Saturday
Night Concert. There will be games and
quizzes. There will be songs and stories.
There will be talks and discussions. There
will be words and pictures (and even a
debate as to which of these two the future
belongs). In this, the year of the 60th anni-
versary of SF conventionsthere will be an
old fashioned fan lounge. Gosh,it all sounds
exciting doesn’tit.

If you want to take part, and there’s no
reason why you shouldn’t then write to us
at the convention address.

Writers' Workshop

Anyoneinterestedin taking part in writ-
ers’ workshopsat intervention should con-
tact Janet Barron,at least a fortnight before
the convention. There my be a small addi-
tional cost for photocopying. The address
to contact is: 3 Ullswater Road, Barre,
London, SW13 9PL. Tel 0181 563 7038
e-mail: 106313.703@compuserve.com

important

Announcement!

If youstill have not received a
hotel booking form or confir-
mation of your room booking,
please get in touch with us as
quickly as possible. Either

write to us or send an e-mail
message to us at the address
given on the contents page. 

Art ShowQ &A
by Tony Cullen

What is Intervention?

Intervention isthe 1997 British National
Science Fiction Convention, to be held at
the Adelphi Hotel, Liverpool on 28-31
March 1997.

Howmuch will it cost to display work in the
Art Show?

There is no charge for displaying art-
work, but the convention charges a 10%
commission onall artwork soldat Interven-
tion. Workwhichis not for sale may also be
displayed, of course.

Do I have to book in advance?

If you don’t, we can’t guarantee that
there will be space for yourwork. Everyone
who booksin advanceis guaranteed atleast
some space. Any unallocated space will be
distributed on a first come, first served
basis. Also, artists who do not book in
advance will not get bid slips and artist
control forms in advance and sowill have to
spend time at the convention preparing
these. Unlessall space is allocated earlier,
cut-off date for advance bookingis 14 March
1997. After this date, but before the con-
vention, we will let you know how much
display space has beenallocated to you.

Do I have to be an attending memberofthe
convention to display artwork?

If you are not attending the convention,
we can arrangefor youto get in to set-up
your work for display, and again whenit
needsto be taken down.If you cannot getto
the convention, then you will have to make
arrangements for someone to act as your
agent to set up/take down, and we can
arrange for them to getinif they are not an
attending member. However, we do needto
know all this in advance.

When can I set up?

Artworkshould be set upbetween Thurs-
day evening (when the display boardswill
probably beset up) and Friday (28 March).
Whenever,it should be as soon as possible
after you arrive at the convention. Any

 



 

space bookedwhichisnot occupied by noon
on Saturday will be reallocated on a first
come first served basis. Please note that
artwork must be set up by the artist or their
agent.

What about bid sheets and control sheets?

Bid sheets shouldbe attached to artwork
whenit set up for display. Two copies of
control sheets should be given to art admin-
istration.

When’s the Art Auction?

Sundayafternoon. Checkthe Programme
Book/Readmefor details.

When do I get paid?

Monday.Afterall sales have been com-
pleted, selling prices are recorded on the
control sheet. Total sales are determined,
commission is assessed, and then theartist
can be paidasthey check outofthe art show.

What forms do I need to complete?

The booking form, and whenreceived,
thebid slips and artist control forms.

Is my work insured while at the convention?

Intervention’s insurance doesn’t cover
artwork, but the convention will cover any
damage caused by gophers.

What presentation media are available?

There are ‘peg-boards’ and supports
which have been used by Eastercons for
years now. These are about4 feet by 4 feet
each. There will also be some tables which
are about 2% feet by 6 feet. We will alsotry
to have the hotel remove the stuff that’s
usually hanging onthe walls of the room for
the hanging of heavier pieces.

Are there any limitations on the amount of
work that may be displayed?

This will have to be determined as we go
along and whensetting up at the conven-
tion. It is very important that we know in
advance both how much space you would
like and what is the minimum youcanlive
with. We will make every effort to display
everything we can. Other thanthat, if you
want to bring 144 one-inch square paint-
ings, by all means do so.

During set-up, can the artist specify where
their work is to be displayed?

With consultation with the artist, art

show administration will determine where
the work will be displayed when theartist
checks in. But we reserve the right to make
the final decision.

Will the convention supply hanging materi-
als?

We will provide ‘normal’ hanging mate-
tials —‘blu-tac’, hooks, Velcro, bulldog clips
etc.—but if any special equipmentis re-
quired for hanging or display, the artist
should providethis.

What is the lighting like in the art-show
room?

The room where the art show is to be
held does have some natural lighting, but
not much. The room will have its usual
artificial lighting, in addition to which will
be some small spotlights for mounting on
the display panels.

Are there any limitations on what may be
displayed?

Historically, the art show hasnever gone
in for censorship, but just in case, we do
reserve the right to ask an artist not to
display a piece whichwe consider question-
able.

What about security?

The art show roomissecured(i.e. locked)
when not open and security is handled by
convention security. While open, there will
be someone at the door to ensure that
people going in and out of the art show do
not take drinks in or take artwork out.
There is also usually a gopher or two wan-
dering around to keep an eye on things.

Who should I contact if I have any more
queries?

Before the convention, myself (see de-
tails below). At the convention, Mary Burns
or Pat McMurray.

Tony Cullen
16 Weaver’s Way
Camden Town
London

NW1 OXE
United Kingdom

Phone: 0171 925 5394 (worktimes)
0171 387 2304 (elsewhen)

e-mail: gummitch@ayla.avnet.co.uk

 



 

Fan Lounge Update

by Steve Green

ith Easter fast approaching, we're
\ x / pulling out the stops to ensure

Intervention’s Fan Lounge is a
worthy addition to the tradition of fan
rooms and programmestreams dating back
to the 1970s.

We’ve already scheduled a varied and
exciting line-up of panels, presentations,
parties and performances, launching on the
Friday afternoon and runningright up until
the early hours of Tuesday. And just to
ensure the appropriate atmosphere is main-
tained all weekend long, the Real Ale bar
will be located just outside our entrance,
opposite the main programme hall.

But we’ve never intended that the Fan
Lounge merely house a non-stop programme
stream. Rather, items will be dotted about
the schedule, allowing the area to concen-
trate on its primary mission: providing an
informal and friendly gatheringplace forall
members, be they veteran fans or newcom-
ers attending their first convention, estab-
lished professionals in the SF field or those
yetto break into print. The central theme of
this event is ‘communication’, and we aim
there should be no area where this is truer
than in the Fan Lounge.

However, westill need your assistanceif
our plans are to becomea reality. The list
below indicatesspecific items currently re-
ceiving our attention, but we'd be just as
glad to hear from you should youhave any
last-minute ideas of your own, or simply
want to volunteer to help out on the day.
After all, the Fan Loungeis intended tobe
a showcaseforall that is weird and wonder-
ful in this fannish community of ours.

Display Items: To reinforce the Fan
Lounge atmosphere,display boards located
around the room will chart the history and
diversity of SF fandom. We need photo-
graphs, newspaper clippings and similar
relics from fandom’s past, which would
obviously be returned after the conventicn.
Dig out your albums and scrapbooks—
embarrass a fan today!

Fannish Readings: A number of gallant
souls have already come forwardandvolun-
teered to bring to life the work of classic
fanwriters, British and American, but we’d

still like more, especially if you have a
favourite short piece in mind,

Parties: Rather than have convention
parties andsimilar fannish events stretch
their finances to hold separate events in
diverse locationsacross the weekend, we’re
offering the chance for them to pool re-
sources and hold one memorable keynote
event on Friday evening, whilst retaining a
platformfor their individual agendas. As a
way of commemorating some of the weird
and wonderfult-shirts and badge designs SF
fandom’s conjured up over the past six
decades, partygoers are invitedto rummage
through their wardrobes and markthe occa-
sion with a dash of fannish retrofashion.

Promotion: Conventionsandlocalgroups
are invited to advertise themselves with
inserts in ring-binders;all we askis that you
limit yourselves to a single A4 sheet.

Fanzines: As wellas Memory Hole, which
will have a set of tables in the Fan Lounge
(see Greg Pickersgill’s article over the page),
we'll be offering space for fanzines to be
sold in aidof various fannish good causes. If
you’re a fanzine editor, please consider
running off a few extra copies or digging
into your backnumbers; if you simply have
fanzinesin yourcollection which you’d like
to see going to an appreciative new home,
please donate them to Memory Hole.

We look forward to seeing youall at
Intervention—and to hearing from every-
one whocan help makethis an Eastercon to
remember.

Contact Addresses: Party organizers
should contact Ray Holloway at 54
Newborough Road, Shirley, Solihull, B90
2HD. For all other Fan Loungeactivities,
contact:

Steve Green
33 Scott Road
Olton
Solihull
B92 7LQ

Tel: 0121 706 0108

 



 

Memory Hole: Fanzines for

the Future

by Greg Pickersgill

he Memory Hole project began in
1994, to recover unwanted or dor-
mant fanzine collections and redis-

tribute them both to new fanzine readers
and to established fans and collectors look-
ing for additionsto their active collections.

Far too many fanzines have beenirre-
trievably lost orthrownaway, andthat’s not
counting those locked into actual living
collections. Probably 75% of the average
fanzine’s print run vanishes—a lot when
one considers print runs of only 150-odd
copies. And it’s a damned peculiar thing
that fans, in general collectors and usually
aghast at the idea of throwing away any
book, especially a rarefirst edition, often
treat fanzines in such a cavalier fashion.
Some suggest that this is because fanzines
are produced for Love rather than Money,
given away rather than sold (or, if sold,
usually at token—less than cost—price),
and thus don’t have the ‘value’ of, say, a
first-edition P.K. Dick novel. This might be
right, but is no excuse. Each fanzine, what-
ever its individual merits (some are genu-
inely brilliant, some simply devalue the
paper they’re printed on) is a potentially
rare first edition, and perhaps might be
valued more in time to comethanit is today.
And that value, I submit, is not and should
not be financial: fanzines are produced for
Love, represent the living culture and his-
tory of SF fandom, and should always be
passed on freely to anyone whowants genu-
inely wants them.

It was with those ideas in mind that
Memory Hole was begun. Since then, the
project has hada great deal of success.
Substantial collections have been passed on
by, for example, Walt Willis and Beryl
Bentcliffe (widow of Eric), and smaller
amounts come in from fans who aren’t
collectors, or collectors weeding theirfiles
of duplicates. A considerable amount of
material comes from, and goesto, the US,
Canada and Australia.

Memory Holeis keen to gather in any
unwanted sciencefiction fanzines (not gam-
ing fanzines, please note, nor single-topic
media-based fanzines) fromyourshed, your
attic, from under your bed, the top of your
wardrobe. We'll arrange to come and pick
up large collections, and will certainly re-
pay any shipping chargesas required if you
are able to package and mail smaller quan-
tities.

We make no charge whatever for our
services (trading in fanzinesis Low, and for
Worms!), but we do shamelessly accept
donations to help cover the various costs
involved, and wecertainly do require that
those asking for either random bundle or
specific issues send money to coverpostage.
MH maybea public service,butit isn’t rich!

Memory Hole also maintains a perma-
nent fanzine collection. This began, based
around my ownpersona!collection, when I
realised that in the eventof a disaster(fire,
flood, meteorite) occurring toVince Clarke’s
home (site of the only other established
fanzine library), there would be no substan-
tial collection of fanzines left anywhere in
Western Europe. So the idea of a ‘Second
Foundation’ seemed sensible verging on
vital. The ‘permacollection’ presently con-
tains around 11000 fanzines: about 2000
different titles, covering the period from
1934 right up to last week. The collection
has been logged on a database and the
current version of the bibliographic cata-
logue is now available on request (free on
disk, on paper by arrangement). The MH
permacollection has strong links with both
Vince Clarke’s Fanlibrary and the SF Foun-
dation at the University of Liverpool; MH
provides materialto fill their deficiencies,
and absorbstheir unwanted material for the
recycling side of theMemory Hole project.

Memory Hole at Intervention

Memory Hole will have a definite pres-
ence at Intervention. We have several tables
reserved inthe Fan Lounge anda substantial
amount of MHrecyclingstock will be avail-
able.

Fanzine Sales: Although Memory Hole
isin principle opposedtotradingin fanzines,
there’s nothing at all wrong with current
faneditorsselling their fanzines at conven-
 



 

tions; indeed, this was doneright at thefirst
real British Fan Room way-backat the 1977
Eastercon, and has been continued at a
variety of conventions, even including the
one in the Glasgow shed, right up to date.

As part ofthe Memory Hole array in the
Fan Lounge, Pll be running fanzine sales
tables: so please, all fanzine editors who
may be attending Intervention, if you’1e
publishing anything between now and then,
or have stocks of recent back issues avail-
able, by all means bring them along and
well hawk theminthe Fan Lounge on your
behalf.

The usual principles apply: we’ll sell
them for your chosen price, and you get the
cash less 10%, which will gothe United Fan
Funds for distribution to whichever fan
fund (Friends of Foundation, TAFF, DUFF,
etc) seems to be most in need at the time.

Any quantity of material can be handled;
all you'll need to dois get it there. No need
to inform us beforehand,just show up with
your material.

For more information, about either ob-
taining fanzines, making donations to MH,
or providing stock for the Fanzine Tablesat
Intervenion, please contact: Greg Pickersgill/
Memory Hole, 3 Bethany Row, Narberth
Road, Haverfordwest, Pembrokeshire,
SA61 2XG (tel. 01437-769671; email
MH@gostak.demon.co.uk).

 

The Masquerade

by John Richards

he Masquerade is one of the few
constants in an Eastercon. You can
drop just about anything else but the

Masqueradestays. It is the event that the
press most wanttosee. Tothe outside world
the Masquerade defines the whole event. SF
conventionsare places where people dress
up in ‘silly’ costumes, that’s it! That’s all
there is! Some people hate the masquerade
for that. They feel that the presence of the
Masquerade holds them upto ridicule. Still
the Masqueradestays.

The reason thatit stays is that in some
waysthe event provides a microcosm of the
convention experience. It can be spectacu-
lar, it can be amusing andit gives everyone
a chance to take part. Above all the Mas-
querade is tremendous fun.

At Intervention the Masqueradewill be
the main event of Sunday night. It will give
entrants a chanceto display levels of crea-
tivity which can range from the design of an
Elizabethan masque with costumes, music
and danceto turning up witha rucksack and
explaining that you are The Unteleported
Man.

Someofthe costumes producedare genu-
ine works of art. They are designed and
made with all the care and attention to
detail of a fashion house or major costume
designer. They canbe magnificent but don’t
let this put you off. Other entries are put
together on the day in the costume work-
shop at the convention and these canbe just
as effective. Indeedit is possible to enter a
Masqueradewith a track suit, a plastic bow
andarrow from Woolworths and a sense of
humourandstill walk off the stage with a
round of applause and an inflatable space
shuttle as a prize.

Entries can be individuals or groups.
Costumes can be wholly original or copies
of existing designs. They must be amateur
productions. By al] means come along as
your favourite character from Star Trek or
Babylon 5S but don’t just walk into Forbid-
den Planet and buy a uniform.

Tech Reminder

If you are runningan item, please
let remember to letus know what
technical support you will need.
By default we will supply comfy
chairs-and that’s your lot! Any-
thing else needs to be asked for,
the sooner you ask, the better
your chance of gettingit.    



 

Evolution Party

byBridget Hardcastle

ast your minds back in time to the
( primordial swamp. Feel that mud

squelch between your newly oppos-
able toes, mmmm. Now cast your minds
forward again by a few billion years, to
Easter 1996, and revel in the intricacies of
the corridors in the Radisson Edwardian
Hotel. Not as squidgy, huh?

Evolution,last year’s Eastercon, is now
thoroughly over and the committee would
like to celebrate and to thank everyone who
worked at the con—so we’re throwing a
party at Intervention! Yes,it’s the late, late
Gopher party. The party will be in the
Adelphi Hotel on the Thursday just before
Intervention, which is why we’re letting
you know about it in advance, in case it
affects your travel plans. So, come along on
Thursday night and be thanked for your
work. And buy a t-shirt. (And do not take
glasses into the pool.)

Hopeto see youthere!

 
   
  

Central Liverpool

Asyouwill see from the map below,the Adelphi Hotelis not far from Liverpool Lime Street
Station. If you are arriving by car and wish to parkit at the hotel, then please contact them
beforehand to book parking space. Space costs £8-00 per 24 hours. The Adelphi's phone
numberis 0151 709 7200.
 

  rereur HeteL (On
< BANELAGH

CA
um
os
't

T
o
S
C
A
L
E
)

    



 

Membership List

This list matches the information we had on 23 January 1997.
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